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The management of neoplastic cell cultures of 
neuroectodermal origin, as a rule, is carried 
out in accordance with the clear protocols 

attached by the cell culture banks when acquiring 
cell lines from them. These requirements allow ac-
curate reproduction of the results of studies on these 
cell lines, rapid production of cellular responses to 
the agent under study, while maintaining the stan
dard culture conditions. However, in some cases, 
the introduction of changes in cultivation conditions 
makes it possible to achieve great success in in vitro 
studies in view of a more vivid extrapolation of phe-
nomena to the living organism of mammals. 

So the cell line of glioma C6 of neuroectoder-
mal origin is widely used as a model of cellular re-

sponses of fibroblast and astrocyte-like cells. The 
general culture conditions for conducting the conflu-
ent culture of this line are described as the DMEM 
or RPMI medium containing 10% fetal bovine se-
rum (FBS). However, given that this cell line con-
sists of four subtypes of cells (astrocyte-, fibroblast-, 
oligodendrocyte-like, and epithelioid cells) that can 
be differentiated with specific antibodies to the glial 
acid fibrillar protein (GFAP) and galactocerebroside. 

Then in some cases it is advisable to apply the 
conditions of the C6 line in which the majority of 
cells will differentiate according to the type of as-
trocyte-like cells.


